BRIGHTON & HOVE CITY COUNCIL
ROAD TRAFFIC REGULATION ACT 1984

BRIGHTON & HOVE (WAITING & LOADING/UNLOADING
RESTRICTIONS AND PARKING PLACES) CONSOLIDATION ORDER 2008
AMENDMENT ORDER No.5 2012

Brighton & Hove City Council in exercise of its powers under Sections |, 2, 3, 4, 19, 32,
35, 35A, 43, 44, 45, 46, 46A, 47, 49, 51, 53, 55, 61, 63, 63A, 66, 117 and 124 (1) (c} & (d)
of the Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 (“the 1984 Act”) as amended and Part 6 of the
Traffic Management Act 2004 and of all other enabling powers after consultation with the
Chief Officer of Police in accordance with Part Il of Schedule 9 to the 1984 Act hereby
makes the above named Order.

The provisions of this Order will come into operation on the [ 5¥ day of May 20120
and amend the Brighton & Hove (Waiting & Loading/Unloading Restrictions and Parking
Places) Consolidation Order 2008, as amended, as follows:

ARTICLE AMENDMENTS:
PART 10 - INDEX OF SCHEDULE |

Part 2 No Loading/Unloading
After existing Part 2.10 add a new Part to the Index as follows:
2.1 | Monday to Saturday 7am to |0am and 4pm to 7pm

Part | | Loading Bays

After existing Part | 1.9 add a new Part to the Index as follows:

11.10 | Monday to Sunday 8am to 6pm (for a period of up to | hour no return
within | hour)

SCHEDULE | AMENDMENTS:

Part 1.1 No Waiting At Any Time

Add new item |2]a: Batemans Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of the
access road to garages at the rear of Nos. | to 39 Batemans Road northwards for a
distance of 5 metres

Add new item 121b: Batemans Road — East side — From the southern kerbline of the
access road to garages at the rear Nos. | to 39 Batemnans Road southwards for a
distance of 5 metres

Amend item 194 Bevendean Road: delete “Both sides™ and substitute “East side”

Add new item [94a: Bevendean Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of Bear
Road northwards to the southern kerbiine of Coombe Road.

Amend item 213 Bishops Road: delete 10 metres™ and substitute “17.5 metres”



Amend item 221 Boundary Road, Brighton: delete the whole description and substitute
“From the southern kerbline of De Courcel Road southwards for a distance of 39
metres

Add new item 247¢: Braybon Avenue — East side — From the northern kerbline of
Greenfield Crescent northwards for a distance of 36 metres

Add new item 280a; Buller Road —~ West side ~ From the northern kerbline of Coombe
Road northwards for a distance of 12.4 metres

Add new item 280b; Buller Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of Coombe
Road northwards for a distance of || metres

Add new item 280c: Burlington Gardens — South side — From the eastern kerbline of Mill
Lane eastwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item 280d: Burlington Gardens — North side — From the eastern kerbline of
Mill Lane eastwards for a distance of 13.5 metres

Add new item 280e: Burnham Close — Both sides — From the eastern kerbline of
Crescent Drive South eastwards for a distance of 8 metres

Renumber existing item 28%9a Buttercup Walk as item 28%
Renumber existing item 289b Buttercup Walk as item 289f

Add new item 28%a: Bute Street — Both sides — From the western kerbline of Livingstone
Street westwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 289b: Bute Street — Both sides — From the eastern kerbline of Livingstone
Street eastwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 368a: Channel View Road — South side — From the western kerbline of
Channel View Road westwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 368b: Channel View Road — South side — From the eastern kerbline of
Channel View Road eastwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 368¢: Channel View Road — Both sides — From the southern kerbline of
Channel View Road southwards for a distance of 5 metres

Amend item 416 Coldean Lane: delete *13.5 metres” and substitute “5 metres”

Add new item 416a: Coldean Lane Slip Road — Both sides — From the northern kerbline
of Hawkhurst Road northwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item 416b: Coldean Lane Slip Road — Both sides — From the southern kerbline
of Hawlchurst Road southwards for a distance of |0 metres



Add new item 424: Coombe Road — North side — From the western kerbline of Buller
Road westwards for a distance of |3 metres

Add new item 425: Coombe Road — North side ~ From the eastern kerbline of Buller
Road eastwards for a distance of 3.3 metres

Add new item 464c: Crescent Drive South — East side — From the northern kerbline of
Burnham Close northwards for a distance of 8 metres

Add new item 464d: Crescent Drive South — East side — From the southern kerbline of
Burnham Close southwards for a distance of 8 metres

Add new item 615: Downland Road — Both sides ~ From the eastern kerbline of Warren
Road eastwards to the western kerbline of Hillview Road

Add new item 702a: Easthill Drive — East side — Erom the common boundary of No. 30 &
No.32 Easthill Drive southwards to the common boundary of No.20 & No.22

Add new item 702b: Easthill Drive — West side — From the northern kerbline of Easthill
Way northwards to the common boundary of No.3 & No.5

Renumber existing item 703a Eastwick Close as item 703b

Add new item 703a: Easthili Way — North side- From the western kerbline of Easthill
Drive westwards to the western boundary of Electrical Sub Station

Add new item 823h: Findon Road — Both sides — From the eastern kerbline of
Whitehawk Road eastwards for a distance of |5 metres

Amend item 842 Foredown Drive: delete the whole description and substitute * West
side from the northern kerbline of Highlands Road northwards for a distance of |5
metres”

Add new item 842a: Foredown Drive — West side — From the southern kerbline of
Highlands Road southwards for a distance of 16 metres

Add new item 895d: Freshfield Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of
Pankhurst Avenue northwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 895e: Freshfield Road — West side — From the southern kerbline of
Pankhurst Avenue southwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add item 906c: Garden Close — West side- From the southern kerbline of The Gardens
southwards for a distance of 6.7 metres

Add item 906d: Garden Close — East side — From the southern kerbline of The Gardens
southwards for a distance of 3.5 metres

Add new item 104]k: Greenfield Crescent — North side — From the eastern kerbline of
Braybon Avenue eastwards for a distance of 14 metres



Add new item 10411: Greenfield Crescent — South side — From the eastern kerbline of
Braybon Avenue eastwards for a distance of 4.5 metres

Add new item 1044a: Greenways — East side — From the northern kerbline of the access
road to Beacon Court and Grange Farm Cottages northwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 1044b: Greenways — East side — From the southern kerbline of the access
road to Beacon Court and Grange Farm Cottages southwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 1054a: Halland Road — From the common boundary of Nos. 75-77 &
Nos.79-81 Halland Road north eastwards for a distance of 12 metres

Add new item 1 166a: Hawkhurst Road — South side — From the western kerbline of
Nanson Road westwards for a distance of |2 metres

Add new item | §66b: Hawkhurst Road — South side — From the eastern kerbline of
Nanson Road eastwards for a distance of 12 metres

Add new item | 166¢c: Hawkhurst Road — Both sides — From the western kerbline of
Coldean Lane Slip Road westwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item | 166d: Hawkhurst Road — Both sides — From the western kerbline of
Coldean Lane westwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item |186: Hendon Street — North side — From the western kerbline of
Livingstone Street westwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item | 187: Hendon Street — North side — From the eastern kerbline of
Livingstone Street eastwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 1371: Kenwards — South side — From the eastern kerbline of Beatty
Avenue eastwards for a distance of 47.5 metres

Delete item 1455: Lewes Road, Brighton

Add new item 1455: Lewes Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of Union
Road northwards to the southern kerbiine of Parlc Crescent

Add new item 1455a: Lewes Road — West side — From the northern kerbfine of Park
Crescent Place to the southern kerbline of Trinity Street

Add new item 1455b: Lewes Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of Trinity
Street northwards to the southern kerbline of St Martin's Street

Add new item 1455¢: Lewes Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of St
Martin's Street northwards for 3.5 metres

Add new item 1455d: Lewes Road — West side — From the southern kerbline of St Paul's
Street southwards for 4.3 metres

Add new item 1455¢e; Lewes Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of St Paul’s
Street northwards to the southern kerbline of St Mary Magdalene Street



Add new item 1455f: Lewes Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of st Mary
Magdalene Street northwards to the southern kerbline of Caledonian Road

Delete item 1456: Lewes Road, Brighton

Add new itermn 1456: Lewes Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of
Caledonian Road northwards to the southern kerbline of Edinburgh Road

Add new item |456a: Lewes Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of
Edinburgh Road northwards to the southern kerbline of Aberdeen Road

Add new item 1456b: Lewes Road — West side — From the southern kerbline of
Inverness Road southwards for 4.5 metres

Add new item 1456c: Lewes Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of
Inverness Road northwards to the south eastern kerbline of Upper Lewes Road

Add new item 1456d: Lewes Road — West side — Northbound Carriageway — From the
north western kerbline of Upper Lewes Road northwards to the southern kerbline of
Hollingdean Road

Add new item 456e: Lewes Road — West side — Erom the northern kerbline of
Hollingdean Road northwards for 42 metres

Delete item {457: Lewes Road, Brighton

Add new item 1457: Lewes Road — West side — Southbound Carriageway — From the
southern kerbline of part of Lewes Road for northbound traffic northwards to the
southern kerbline of Hollingdean Road

Add new item 1457a: Lewes Road — East side — From a prolongation of the northern
kerbline of Union Road northwards to the southern kerbline of Elm Grove

Add new item 1457b: Lewes Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of Elm
Grove northwards to the northern boundary wall of No.19 Gladstone Terrrace

Add new item |1457c: Lewes Road — East side — From the southern kerbline of the
southern arm of St Martin's Place southwards for 32.8 metres

Add new item 1457d: Lewes Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of the
southern arm of St Martin’s Place northwards to the southern kerbline of the northern
arm of St Martin's Place

Add new item 1457e: Lewes Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of the
northern arm of St Martin’s Place northwards to the southern kerbline of Franklin Road

Add new item |457f: Lewes Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of Franklin
Road northwards for 9.6 metres

Delete item 1458; Lewes Road



Add new item |458: Lewes Road — East side — From the southern kerbline of St
Leonard’s Road southwards for 3.6 metres

Add new item 1458a: Lewes Road — East side - From the northern kerbline of St
Leonard's Road northwards for 2.5 metres

Add new item |458b: Lewes Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of Pevensey
Road northwards to the southern kerbline of Hartington Road

Add new item 1458c: Lewes Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of
Hartington Road northwards to the southern kerbline of the southern arm of Melbourne
Street

Add new item 1458d: Lewes Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of the
southern arm of Melbourne Street northwards to the southern kerbline of the northern
arm of Melbourne Street

Add new itern 1458e; Lewes Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of the
northern arm of Melbourne Street northwards to the southern kerbline of Gladstone
Place

Delete item 1459: Lewes Road, Brighton

Add new item 1459: Lewes Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of Gladstone
Place northwards to the southern kerbline of Newmarket Road

Add new item 1459a: Lewes Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of
Newmarket Road northwards to the southern kerbline of Bear Road

Add new item 1459b: Lewes Road — East side — Northbound Carriageway — From the
western kerbline of the southbound carriageway of Lewes Road (at it's southern most
limit) westwards and northwards to the western kerbline of the southbound carriageway
of Lewes Road (at it's northern most limit)

Add new item 1481a: Livingstone Street — Both sides — From the southern kerbline of
Rochester Street southwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 1481b: Livingstone Street — Both sides — From the northern kerbline of
Bute Street northwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 1481 c: Livingstone Street — Both sides — From the southern kerbline of
Bute Street southwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 1481d: Livingstone Street — Both sides — From the northern kerbline of
Hendon Street northwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 1506c: London Road (A23) — West side — From a point 8.5 metres north
of the northern kerbline of the access road to Patcham Place Recreation Ground
northwards for a distance of 25 metres



Add new item |515a: Longhill Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of
Wanderdown Road northwards for a distance of 8 metres

Add new item |515b: Longhill Road — East side — From the southern kerbline of
Wanderdown Road southwards for a distance of 8 metres

Renumber existing item [563a Manor Crescent as item 1563c

Add new item 1563a: Manor Close — Both sides — From the southern kerbline of Manor
Way southwards for a distance of 6 metres

Add new item 1627a: Meadow Close — North side — From the western kerbline of the
path between Nos. 6 & 7 Meadow Close eastwards for a distance of 8 metres

Add new item 1627b: Meadow Close — Fast side — From a point 39.5 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Easthill Drive northwards for a distance of 1 | metres

Add new item |1687a: Millcross Road — North side — From the western kerbline of Mill
Lane westwards for a distance of 17 metres

Add new item 1687b: Milicross Road ~ South side — From the western kerbline of Mill
Lane westwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item 1689b: Mill Lane — West side — From the northern kerbline of Millcross
Road northwards for a distance of 50 metres

Add new item [689¢: Mill Lane — East side — From the northern kerbline of Burlington
Gardens northwards for a distance of 2| metres

Add new item 1689d: Mill Lane — West side ~ From the southern kerbline of Millcross
Road southwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item |68%e: Mill Lane — East side — From the southern kerbline of Burlington
Gardens southwards for a distance of 14 metres

Add new item |715a: Nanson Road — Both sides — From the southern lkerbline of
Hawkhurst Road southwards for a distance of |12 metres

Add new item 1882a: Oakdene Close — East side — From the southern kerbline of
Oakdene Crescent southwards for a distance of |10 metres

Add new item [882b: Oakdene Close — West side — From the southern boundary of
No.I | Oakdene Close northwards to western kerbline of Oakdene Crescent

Add new item 1959%a: Pankhurst Avenue — Both sides — From the western kerbline of
Freshfield Road westwards for a distance of 5 metres

Amend item 1989 Park Road: delete “46 metres” and substitute “35.5 metres”



Amend item 2158 Queensdown School Road: delete the whole description and
substitute “From the western kerbline of the university access road westwards for a
distance of 8 metres

Add new item 2158a: Queensdown School Road — North and East side - The entire
length

Add new item 2158b: Queensdown School Road — South side — From the western
kerbline of Lewes Road westwards for a distance of 16 metres

Add new item 2158¢c: Queensdown School Road — South side — From the eastern
kerbline of the access road between Huxley & Cockeroft Buildings eastwards for a
distance of 8 metres

Add new item 2158d: Queensdown School Road — South side — From the western
kerbline of the access road between Huxley & Cockeroft Buildings westwards for a

distance of 48.5 metres

Add new item 2199a: Rochester Street — South side — From the western kerbline of
Livingstone Street westwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 2199b: Rochester Street — South side — From the eastern kerbline of
Livingstone Street eastwards for a distance of 5 metres

Amend item 22! | Roedean Road: delete “a point 18 metres east of the eastern kerbline
of The Cliff’ and substitute “the western kerbline of The CIiff”

Add new item 2213a: Roedean Way — North side ~ From the western flank wall of No.4
Roedean Way eastwards for a distance of 44.8 metres

Add new item 2375a: Selsfield Drive — North side — Entire length of the island at the
junction with Thorndean Road

Amend item 247 | Springfield Road: delete *22 metres” and substitute “24.2 metres”
Delete and reinstate item 2552a: Stephens Road

Delete and reinstate item 2552b: Stephens Road

Amend item 2670a The Droveway: delete *10 metres” and substitute *18 metres”

Add new item 2678a: The Gardens — South side — From the western kerbline of Garden
Close westward, northwards and eastwards for a distance of 45 metres

Add new item 2678b: The Gardens — South side ~ From the eastern kerbline of Garden
Close eastwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item 2739c; Thorndean Road — West and East sides — Entire length of the
island at the junction with Selsfield Drive



Add new item 2739d: Thorndean Road — West, South & East side — Entire length of the
island situated outside flats {57 to 162 Thorndean Road

Add new item 2739%e: Thorndean Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of
Selsfield Drive northwards for a distance of 20.5 metres

Add new item 2739f: Thorndean Road - East side — From a point 3 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Selsfield Drive northwards for a distance of 16 metres

Add new item 2906: Wanderdown Road — Both sides — From the eastern kerbline of
Longhill Road eastwards for a distance of 8 metres

Add new item 3000c: Whitehawlk Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of
Findon Road northwards for a distance of |3 metres

Add new item 3000d: Whitehawk Road — Fast side — From the southern kerbline of
Findon Road southwards for a distance of 10.5 metres

Part [.4 No Waiting Monday to Saturday 8.00 am to 6.00 pm
Amend item 66a Victoria Road, Portslade: delete “33 metres” and substitute “22.2
metres” delete “{4 metres” and substitute “23 metres”

Part 1.8 No Waiting Monday to Friday 8.00am to 6pm
Delete item |: Queensdown School Road, Brighton

Delete item 2: Selham Drive, Brighton

Add new item 2: Sefham Drive ~ North side — From the prolongation of the western
kerbline of Selham Close westwards for a distance of 40 metres

After Part 2.10 insert a new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 2.11 No Loading/Unloading Monday to Saturday 7am to }0am and 4 pm

to 7pm
Ref . . Order
No. Road Name | Side Description Date

From the northern kerbline of Union
| Lewes Road West | Road northwards to the southern
kerbline of Park Crescent

From the northern kerbline of Park
2 Lewes Road West | Crescent Place northwards to the
southern kerbline of Trinity Street
From the northern kerbline of
Trinity Street southwards to the
southern kerbline of St Martin’s
Street

From the northern kerbline of St
Paul’s Street northwards to the
southern kerbline of St Mary
Magalene Street

5 Lewes Road West | From the northern kerbline of St

3 Lewes Road VWest

4 Lewes Road West




Mary Magdalene Street northwards
to the southern kerbline of
Caledonian Road

Lewes Road

West

From the northern kerbline of
Caledonian Road northwards to the
southern kerbline of Edinburgh Road

Lewes Road

Waeast

From the northern kerbline of
Edinburgh Road northwards to the
southern kerbline of Aberdeen Road

Lewes Road

VWWest

From the northern kerbline of
Inverness Road northwards to the
south eastern kerbline of Upper
Lewes Road

{ ewes Road

West

Northbound Carriageway ~ From
the north western kerbline of Upper
Lewes Road northwards to the
southern kerbline of Hollingdean
Road

Lewes Road

West

From the northern kerbline of
Hollingdean Road northwards for 42
metres

Lewes Road

West

Southbound Carriageway — From the
southern kerbline of the part of
Lewes Road for northbound traffic
northwards to the southern kerbiine
of Hollingdean Road

Lewes Road

East

From a prolongation of the northern
kerbline of Union Road northwards
to the southern kerbline of Elm
Grove

Lewes Road

East

From the northern kerbline of Eim
Grove northwards to the northern
boundary wall of No.19 Gladstone
Terrace

Lewes Road

East

From the southern kerbline of the
southern arm of St Martin's Place
southwards for 32.8 metres

Lewes Road

East

From the northern kerbline of the
southern arm of St Martin’s Place
northwards to the southern kerbline
of the northern arm of St Martin's
Place

Lewes Road

East

From the northern kerbline of the
northern arm of St Martin’s Place
northwards to the southern kerbline
of Franklin Road

Lewes Road

East

From the northern kerbline of
Pevensey Road northwards to the
southern kerbline of Hartington
Road

10




From the northern kerbline of
Hartington Road northwards to the
southern kerbline of the southern
arm of Melbourne Street

From the northern kerbiine of the
southern arm of Melbourne Street
19 | Lewes Road East | northwards to the southern kerbline
of the northern arm of Melbourne
Street

From the northern kerbline of the
northern arm of Melbourne Street
northwards to the southern kerbline
of Gladstone Place

From the northern kerbline of
Gladstone Place northwards to the

I8 | Lewes Road East

20 | Lewes Road East

2l Lewes Road Fast southern kerbline of Newmarket
Road
From the northern kerbline of

22 | Lewes Road East | Newmarket Road northwards to the

southern kerbline of Bear Road
Northbound Carriageway — From
the western kerbline of the
southbound carriageway of Lewes
Road (at it's southern most fimit),
westwards and northwards to the
western kerbline of the southbound
carriageway of Lewes Road (at it's
northern most limit)

23 | Lewes Road East

Part 3.2 Clearway Monday to Saturday 8.00 am to 9.30 am and 4.00 pm to

6.00 pm
Delete item 2: Lewes Road, Brighton

Part 5.5 Limited waiting for I hour (no return within | hour) Monday to

Saturday 8am to 6pm
Amend item 20a Victoria Road, Portslade: delete “22.2 metres” and substitute “13.2

metres”

Part 5.12 Limited waiting for 2 hours (no return within | hour) Monday to
Saturday 9am to épm

Amend item 5 Park Road, Rottingdean: delete “27.2 metres” and substitute “32.7
metres” delete “25.2 metres” and substitute *“19.7 metres”

Part 6.1 Disabled Parking Bay At Any Time

Add new item 48c: Bexhill Road — East side — From the boundary wall between Nos. 193
& 195 southwards for a distance of 5.5m (outside No.[95)

Delete item 52b: Bodiam Avenue, Brighton (outside No.|2)

Amend item 53 Bolney Road: delete the whole description and substitute “South side -

11



From the boundary between Nos. 28 & 30 Bolney Road westwards for a distance of 5.5
metres (outside No.28)

Amend item 284c Hawkhurst Place, Hawkhurst Road: delete [0 metres” and substitute
“4.5 metres” delete “(outside No.4)" and substitute “(outside No.3)"

Delete item 318: Hollingdean Terrace, Brighton (outside No.186)

Delete item 358b: Ladysmith Road, Brighton (outside No.47)

Renumber existing item 370 Leybourne Close (outside No.l}) as item 370a

Delete item 478: North Road, Portslade (outside No.30)

Delete item 580a: Selsfield Drive, Brighton (outside Nos.251/255)

Delete item 608b: Springfield Road, Brighton (outside No.94)

Delete item 608d: St Andrews Road, Brighton (outside No.12)

Renumber existing item 630 Staplefield Drive (opposite No.44) as item 630a
Renumber existing item 63 | Staplefield Drive (outside No.45) as item 631a

Renumber existing item 639 Staplefield Drive (outside No.95) as item 638

Add new item 641: Staplefield Drive — South side — From a point 34.1 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Birdham Road eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (adjoining
No.143)

Delete item 642: Stapley Road, Hove (outside No.|21)

Part 6.2 Disabled Badge Holders Parking limited to 3 hours (no return within
I hour)

Delete item 7: St Paul's Street, Brighton (outside No.!}

Part | 1.1 Loading Bay At Any Time

Amend item 2 Lewes Road: delete “| metre” and substitute “3.5 metres” delete “5.5
metres” and substitute “23.6 metres”

Amed item 3 Lewes Road: delete the whole description and substitute “VWest side —
From a point 4.5 metres south of the southern kerbline of Inverness Road southwards
for a distance of 23 metres”

Amend item 4 Lewes Road: delete “22 metres” and substitute “8.2 metres”

Add new item 4a: Lewes Road — East side — From a point 47.2 metres south of the

southern kerbline of the southern arm of St Martins Place southwards for a distance of
8.2 metres

12



Amend item5 Lewes Road: delete *“10.5 metres” and substitute “9.6 metres” delete “8.5
metres” and substitute *13.5 metres”

Amend item 6 Lewes Road: delete “5 metres” and substitute “2.5 metres” delete “28
metres” and substitute “29 metres”

Part 1 1.2 Loading 8am to 6pm every day
Add new item 3b: Valley Road — East side — From a point 7.5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of The Crossway southwards for a distance of 10 metres

After Part 11,9 insert a new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part [1.10 Loading Bay Monday to Sunday 8am to 6pm (for a period of up to
| hour no return within [ hour)

Ref , — Order
No. Road Name | Side Description Date

From a point 7.2 metres west of the
Park Road, North | WYestern kerbline of High Street
Rottingdean westwards for a distance of 10
metres

THE COMMON SEAL OF BRIGHTON & HOVE )
CITY COUNCIL was affixed hereto this 25" day of )

Apn'l Two Thousand and Tielve )
in the presence of

i

Authorised Persen

13






